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Townhouse Nilo in Altos del Rodeo, Nueva Andalucia

998.000€
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Ref MCG1787

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3

Status For Sale

Type Townhouses

Built 235 m²

Terrace 70 m²

Price 998.000€







About this property

**AVAILABLE IN OCTOBER!**

Nestled in the heart of Nueva Andalucía, Townhouse Nilo in
Altos del Rodeo offers the epitome of Marbella living,
combining unmatched comfort and elegance. Just a short
stroll from the golden sands of Mistral Beach and a minute’s
drive from local shops, this south-facing property, fully
renovated in 2024, provides not only stunning mountain views
but also easy access to Puerto Banús, famed for its luxury
boutiques and vibrant nightlife.

With a total of 235 sqm, including 165 sqm of beautifully
designed interior living space and an expansive 70 sqm
terrace, this townhouse offers a rare blend of privacy and
spaciousness in such a prime location. Upon entering the first
floor, you are greeted by a stylish porch with practical
storage solutions, leading to a seamless open-plan living area.
The kitchen, outfitted with modern Siemens appliances and a
welcoming island, is the perfect setting for culinary creativity.
This floor also includes a guest toilet and an en-suite
bedroom, ensuring comfort and convenience for both
residents and visitors.

The architectural design of this property marries modern
living with classic elegance. On the second floor, the master
bedroom offers a luxurious en-suite bathroom and a private
balcony, perfect for enjoying peaceful morning coffees. An
additional en-suite bedroom with its own balcony further
enhances the living experience.

The highlight of Townhouse Nilo is the third-floor rooftop
terrace, designed for relaxation and entertainment. This
exceptional space features a BBQ area, a plunge pool, and
an outdoor kitchen, all with breathtaking views of the
surrounding landscape. It’s the ideal spot to enjoy Marbella’s
famous sunsets or host memorable gatherings.

Every aspect of the townhouse reflects the high standards set
by its developers and architect, evident in the modern,
elegant furnishings and thoughtful layout. The community
enhances this sense of luxury, offering a swimming pool and
lush garden areas, making it an exclusive retreat.

In addition to its impressive design and amenities, Townhouse
Nilo boasts an enviable location close to essential services
and leisure spots. The prestigious Real Club de Padel and the
Swedish store Miadel are just a short walk away, while local
schools are conveniently located within a seven-minute drive,
simplifying daily logistics.

Living at Townhouse Nilo offers the best of Nueva Andalucía,
one of Marbella’s most sought-after residential areas. Enjoy
easy access to the vibrant beaches of Puerto Banús, known
for its dynamic atmosphere and high-end shopping. The area
is also famous for its sports facilities, including the renowned
Real Club de Padel Marbella and the nearby Aloha Golf
Club, an 18-hole course that’s a favorite among golf
enthusiasts.

The area’s dining options are equally impressive. La Sala By
the Sea provides chic beachfront dining, while El Gaucho de
Banús offers authentic Argentine cuisine. Magna Café is
perfect for fine dining with views over the adjacent golf
course. For shopping, Centro Plaza Marbella and El Corte
Inglés Puerto Banús are nearby, offering a range of
boutiques, restaurants, and a lively local market.

Families will appreciate the reputable schools in the area,
such as Aloha College and Svenska Skolan Marbella, known
for their high-quality education. Excellent public transport
options, including bus routes L-4 and L-6, make getting
around Marbella easy, while the AP-7 motorway provides
straightforward access to larger cities like Málaga.

Beyond the practical amenities, the townhouse’s location
offers stunning natural beauty, with the iconic La Concha
Mountain providing a breathtaking backdrop. Known as ‘Golf
Valley,’ Nueva Andalucía is home to several premier golf
courses, including Los Naranjos, Las Brisas, and Aloha,
making this neighborhood highly desirable.

Townhouse Nilo is designed not just as a residence but as a
complete lifestyle experience. Its proximity to beaches, sports
facilities, a variety of dining options, shopping centers, and
top-tier educational institutions, combined with efficient
transport links, offers a tranquil yet connected lifestyle in
Marbella. With three beautifully appointed bedrooms, each
with an en-suite bathroom, a guest toilet, additional features
like a carport storage, and a communal swimming pool, this
property is ideal for discerning individuals seeking a standout
living space in Marbella.

This townhouse is a masterpiece of contemporary
architecture, showcasing meticulous attention to detail and
innovative design. It promises a serene and luxurious lifestyle,
standing as a testament to superior craftsmanship in one of
Marbella’s most coveted locations. More than just a home,
Townhouse Nilo offers an experience of tranquility and
prestige, making it a prime property for any sophisticated
buyer.

A furniture package is available for €30,000.
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